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4 CYCLE JUNIOR I LITE  Age 8 to 10 years - 250 lbs. - Methanol only - Approved engine: Briggs & Stratton 
stock 5hp only, with .425 inch maximum intake restrictor, no steering fairing allowed, maximum nose height 
14 inches from ground level to top of nose, and Exhaust Silencer Required 
 
4 CYCLE JUNIOR I HEAVY Age 8 to 10 years - 265 lbs. - Methanol only - Approved engine: Briggs & 
Stratton stock 5hp only, with .425 inch maximum intake restrictor, no steering fairing allowed, maximum 
nose height 14 inches from ground level to top of nose, and Exhaust Silencer Required 
 
4 CYCLE JUNIOR II LITE Age 10 to 12 years - 265 lbs. - Methanol only - Approved engine: Briggs & 
Stratton stock 5hp only, with .500 inch maximum intake restrictor, no steering fairing allowed, maximum 
nose height 14 inches from ground level to top of nose, allowed and Exhaust Silencer Required 
 
4 CYCLE JUNIOR II HEAVY Age 10 to 12 years - 280 lbs. - Methanol only - Approved engine: Briggs & 
Stratton stock 5hp only, with .500 inch maximum intake restrictor, no steering fairing allowed, maximum 
nose height 14 inches from ground level to top of nose, and Exhaust Silencer Required 
 
4 CYCLE JUNIOR III LITE Age 12 to 15 years - 290 lbs. - Methanol only - Approved engine: Briggs & 
Stratton stock 5hp only, with .575 inch maximum intake restrictor, and Exhaust Silencer Required 
 
4 CYCLE JUNIOR III HEAVY Age 12 to 15 years - 310 lbs. - Methanol only - Approved engine: Briggs & 
Stratton stock 5hp only, with .575 inch maximum intake restrictor, and Exhaust Silencer Required 
 
4 CYCLE SENIOR LITE Age 15 years & up - 325 lbs. - Methanol only -Approved engine: Briggs & Stratton 
stock 5hp only, with Exhaust Silencer Required  
 
4 CYCLE SENIOR MEDIUM Age 15 years & up - 345 lbs. - Methanol only -Approved engine: Briggs & 
Stratton stock 5hp only, with Exhaust Silencer Required 
 
4 CYCLE SENIOR HEAVY Age 15 years & up - 365 lbs. - Methanol only -Approved engine: Briggs & 
Stratton stock 5hp only, with Exhaust Silencer Required 
 
4 CYCLE SPORTSMAN Age 35 years & up - 365 lbs. - Methanol only -Approved engine: Briggs & Stratton 
stock 5hp only, with Exhaust Silencer Required 
 
BRIGGS 206 KID KART  Age 5 thru 8 years – Kid Kart Chassis 200 lbs.: Cadet Chassis 215 lbs. –  
206 Junior engines with Carb Lock  per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual.- BS (#555732)  .310 “Black” Slide 
required with 4,100 RPM Rev Limiter RLV #5506 of #5507 Exhaust W-silencer required, Pull starter must 
be present and remain stock. chest protector is mandatory. 
 
BRIGGS 206 CADET  Age 8 thru 10 years – 245 lbs. – 206 Junior engines with Carb Lock  per 2024 TAG™ 
Tech Manual.- BS (#555733) “Red” Slide required Exhaust silencer required, Pull starter must be present 
and remain stock. chest protector is mandatory, Cadet Chassis Only 
 
BRIGGS 206 SPORTSMAN Age 10 thru 13 years – 275 lbs. – 206 Junior engines with Carb Lock  per 2024 
TAG™ Tech Manual.- 490 restrictor - BS (#555733)  Green slide Required , Exhaust silencer required, Pull 
starter must be present and remain stock. chest protector is mandatory. 

 
BRIGGS 206 JR  Age 11 thru 15 years – 320 lbs. – 206 Junior engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual.MFG 
Supplied Carb with Gold Slide BS: #555741 required RLV #5506 of #5507 Exhaust W-silencer required, Pull 
starter must be present and remain stock. 
 
BRIGGS 206 SENIOR LIGHT  Age 15 years & up - 340 lbs. – 206 engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual. 
MFG Supplied. Carb with Stock Slide BS: #555590 required RLV #5506 of #5507 Exhaust W-silencer 
required, Pull starter must be present and remain stock. 
 
BRIGGS 206 SENIOR MEDIUM  Age 15 years & up - 365 lbs. – 206 engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual. 
MFG Supplied. Carb with Stock Slide BS: #555590 required RLV #5506 of #5507 Exhaust W-silencer 
required, Pull starter must be present and remain stock. 
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BRIGGS 206 SENIOR HEAVY  Age 15 years & up - 390 lbs. – 206 engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual. 
MFG Supplied. Carb with Stock Slide BS: #555590 required RLV #5506 of #5507 Exhaust W-silencer 
required, Pull starter must be present and remain stock. 
 
BRIGGS  206 MASTERS AGE 35 years & up - 390 lbs. - 206 engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual. MFG 
Supplied Carb with Stock Slide BS: #555590 required RLV #5506 of #5507 Exhaust W-silencer required, 
Pull starter must be present and remain stock. 
 

BRIGGS  SR 206 LEGENDS AGE 50 years & up - 380 lbs. - 206 engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual. 
MFG Supplied Carb with Stock Slide BS: #555590 required RLV #5506 of #5507 Exhaust W-silencer 
required, Pull starter must be present and remain stock. 
 

SPRINT 4 CYCLE NOVICE (ANIMAL & FLAT HEAD) Age 8 thru 11 years – Animal 250 lbs – triple hole red 
restrictor. Flat Head 250 lbs – 5 hp Briggs & Stratton engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual. Exhaust 
silencers required. 0.500 (turquoise) restrictor plate required.  NO steering fairings, the CIK number panel is 
legal, overall nose height maximum of 16" measured from ground, chest protector is mandatory. 
 

SPRINT JUNIOR 4-CYCLE (ANIMAL & FLAT HEAD) Age 12 thru 15 years – 300 lbs. Briggs & Stratton 
5hp with .575 restrictor or Briggs & Stratton Stock Animal 6.5hp w/.360  throttle stop maximum exhaust pipe 
length 24” may be one or two piece must be inside bumper. Alcohol only allowed. Exhaust silencers 
required.  Aftermarket connecting rods are allowed, stock length only, chest protector is mandatory for JR 
participants 
 

BRIGGS SPRINT ANIMAL Junior Age 11 thru 15 years – 300 lbs–Briggs & Stratton Stock Animal 
6.5hp.Gas only or Alcohol only allowed. Exhaust silencers required.  Aftermarket connecting rods are 
allowed, stock length only, chest protector is mandatory for JR participants 
 

BRIGGS SPRINT ANIMAL 370 Age 15 years & up - 370 lbs. - Alcohol only - Briggs & Stratton engines. 
Exhaust silencers required. Aftermarket connecting rods are allowed. 
 
BRIGGS SPRINT ANIMAL 390 Age 15 years & up - 390 lbs. - Alcohol only - Briggs & Stratton engines. 
Exhaust silencers required. Aftermarket connecting rods are allowed. 
 
4 CYCLE SUPERSTOCK Age 15 years & up - 370 lbs. - Methanol only - Approved engine: Briggs & 
Stratton stock 5hp only, with any Tillotson HL (except HL334A) series carburetor with .900 inch maximum 
venturi diameter, any single piece intake manifold and Exhaust Silencer Required Auxiliary vacuum fuel 
pump, pulsed from the intake, is permitted.      
 

BRIGGS LIMITED MODIFIED Age 15 years & up - 360 lbs. - Methanol only -Approved engine: Briggs & 
Stratton 5hp with any Tillotson HL-series carburetor with .850 inch minimum and .900 inch maximum venturi 
diameter, and Exhaust Silencer Required Auxiliary vacuum fuel pump, pulsed from the intake, is permitted.      
 
4 CYCLE CLONE NOVICE  Age 7 thru 11 years – 225 lbs. – 6.5 clone engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech 
Manual.. ARC/.550” Blue Restrictor, RLV-R91 Exhaust Silencer required Length on header and muffler 
minimum 18” Max length 22” Header must be single stage 1” OD Maximum outside diameter, Pull starter 
must be present and remain stock chest protector is mandatory. 
 

4 CYCLE CLONE  JR Age 11 thru 15 years – 305 lbs. – 6.5 clone engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual.. 
RLV-R91 Exhaust Silencer required Length on header and muffler minimum 18” Max length 22” Header 
must be single stage 1” OD Maximum outside diameter, Pull starter must be present and remain stock 
chest protector is mandatory. 
 

4 CYCLE CLONE  SR Age 15 years & up – 360 lbs– 6.5 clone engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual.. 
RLV-R91 Exhaust Silencer required Length on header and muffler minimum 18” Max length 22” Header 
must be single stage 1” OD Maximum outside diameter, Pull starter must be present and remain stock. 
 

4 CYCLE CLONE  MASTERS Age 30 years & up – 385 lbs– 6.5 clone engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech 
Manual.. Exhaust Silencer required Length on header and muffler minimum 18” Max length 22” Header must 
be single stage 1” OD Maximum outside diameter,  
 

4 CYCLE CLONE  BULLDERS SR Age 15 years & up – 360 lbs– 6.5 clone engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech 
Manual.. Exhaust Silencer required Length on header and muffler minimum 18” Max length 22” Header must 
be single stage 1” OD Maximum outside diameter, Approved SFI certified billet aluminum flywheel only  
 
4 CYCLE CLONE  STOCK APPEARING SR Age 15 years & up – 385 lbs– 6.5 clone engines per 2024 
TAG™ Tech Manual.. Exhaust silencer required, Approved SFI certified billet aluminum flywheel only 
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FORMULA-OHV Age 15 years & up - 360 lbs. – Gas only - Approved engines are overhead valve 4 cycle 
engines as follows: Kohler C6 XKE, Briggs & Stratton Intek 5.5 and Animal, Honda GX-200 and Tecumseh 
OHH55 – Exhaust Silencer Required     
  
BRIGGS CHAMP KART Age 15 years & up - 410 lbs. - Methanol only - Approved engine: Briggs & Stratton 
stock 5hp only. Exhaust Silencer Required    
 
JUNIOR CHAMP KART Age 12 to 15 years - 345 lbs. - Methanol only - Approved engine: Briggs & Stratton 
stock 5hp only. Exhaust Silencer Required    
 
JUNIOR SPORTSMAN CHAMP KART Age 8 to 12 years - 315 lbs. - Methanol only - Approved engine: 
Briggs & Stratton stock 5hp only, with .425 inch maximum intake restrictor, Exhaust Silencer Required    
 
 
BRIGGS WORLD FORMULA JR  Age 11 thru 15 years – 300 lbs. – World Formula Junior engines per 2024 
TAG™ Tech Manual.-  Exhaust silencer required. chest protector is mandatory. 
 
BRIGGS WORLD FORMULA SR  Age 15 years & up - 390 lbs. – World Formula engines per 2024 TAG™  
Tech Manual.. Exhaust silencer required  
 
BRIGGS WORLD FORMULA MASTERS  Age 30 years & up - 405 lbs. – World Formula engines per 2024 
TAG™  Tech Manual.. Exhaust silencer required 
 
TILLOTSON T225 CADET  Age 7 thru 10 years – 200 lbs. – T225 TR engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech 
Manual.-  Exhaust silencer required. chest protector is mandatory. 
 
TILLOTSON T225 JR  Age 11 thru 15 years – 300 lbs. – T225 TR engines per 2024 TAG™ Tech Manual.-  
Exhaust silencer required. chest protector is mandatory. 
 
TILLOTSON T225 SR  Age 15 years & up - 350 lbs. – T225 TR engines per 2024 TAG™  Tech Manual.. 
Exhaust silencer required  
 
TILLOTSON T225 MASTERS  Age 30 years & up - 390 lbs. – T225 TR engines per 2024 TAG™  Tech 
Manual.. Exhaust silencer required 
 
KID KARTS* Age 5 to 7 years – Gas and oil only - Approved engine: Comer 50cc Box stock, unaltered, 1.8 
HP, fixed jet carburetor, stock exhaust required, unaltered 89 tooth sprocket, maximum nose height 14 
inches from ground level to top of nose. 
 
YAMAHA SPORTSMAN LITE Age 15 years & up - 340 lbs. - Gas and oil only - Approved engine: Yamaha 
KT100S only, with RLV SSX exhaust. approved air box required. 
 
YAMAHA SPORTSMAN HEAVY Age 15 years & up - 365 lbs. - Gas and oil only - Approved engine: 
Yamaha KT100S only, with RLV SSX exhaust, approved air box required. 
 
UNLIMITED 2-CYCLE   Age 16 years & up – Fuel Open – a) 100cc - 315 lbs, b) 135cc - 345 lbs, c) up to 
150cc - 360 lbs, Any reciprocating, normally aspTAGted, single-cylinder 2-cycle engine up to 150cc without 
gearbox. approved air box required. 
 
 
 
 

 


